CITY OF RICHMOND ORDINANCE NO. 2009-01

AN ORDINANCE OF THE CITY OF RICHMOND, TEXAS ADOPTING THE
2006 EDITION OF THE INTERNATIONAL PLUMBING CODE, AS THE
PLUMBING CODE FOR THE CITY OF RICHMOND, TEXAS REGULATING
AND GOVERNING THE DESIGN, CONSTRUCTION, QUALITY OF
MATERIALS, ERECTION, INSTALLATION, ALTERATION, REPAIR,
LOCATION, RELOCATION, REPLACEMENT, ADDITION TO, USE OR
MAINTENANCE OF PLUMBING SYSTEMS IN THE CITY OF RICHMOND,
TEXAS; PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND
COLLECTION OF FEES THEREFOR; AND PROVIDING PENALTIES NOT
TO EXCEED TWO THOUSAND DOLLARS AND; REPEALING ORDINANCE
NO. 2005-01 OF THE CITY OF RICHMOND, TEXAS AND ALL OTHER
ORDINANCES AND PARTS OF THE ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT
THEREWITH.

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE CITY COMMISSION OF THE CITY OF RICHMOND, TEXAS:

SECTION 1

A certain document filed in the office of the City Secretary of the City of Richmond, Texas,
marked and designated as the International Plumbing Code, 2006 Edition including Appendix
Chapters B, C, D, E, F, and G, as published by the International Code Council, be and is hereby
adopted as the Plumbing Code of the City of Richmond, in the State of Texas
regulating and governing the design, construction, quality of materials, erection, installation,
alteration, repair, location, relocation, replacement, addition to, use or maintenance of plumbing
systems as herein provided; providing for the issuance of permits and collection of fees therefor;
and each and all of the regulations, provisions, penalties, conditions and terms of said Plumbing
Code filed in the office of the City Secretary of the City of Richmond, Texas are hereby referred
to, adopted, and made a part hereof, as if fully set out in this ordinance, with the additions,
insertions, deletions and changes, prescribed in Section 2 of this ordinance.

SECTION 2

The following sections are hereby revised:
101.1 Title. Insert in brackets:

“CITY OF RICHMOND, TEXAS”

Ordinance No. 2009-01  -- City of Richmond, Texas --  -- Plumbing Code 2006 -- 01-20-09 Page 1 of §



102.6 Historic buildings is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

“102.6 Historic buildings. The provisions of this code relating to the construction,
alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration, relocation or moving of buildings or structures
may not be mandatory for existing buildings or structures identified and classified by the
state or local jurisdiction as historic buildings when such buildings or structures are
judged by the code official to be safe and in the public interest of health, safety and
welfare regarding any proposed construction, alteration, repair, enlargement, restoration,
“relocation or moving of buildings.”

102.7 Moved buildings is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

“102.7 Moved buildings. Plumbing systems that are a part of buildings or structures
moved into or within the jurisdiction shall comply with the provisions of this code for
new installations.”

102.8 Referenced codes and standards is hereby amended by adding the following:

“Exceptions: All references to the IZC—O06 International Zoning Code®, International
Existing Building Code® and the ICC EC—06 ICC Electrical Code® shall be removed
throughout this code.”

106.4 By whom application is made is hereby amended by adding the following:

“106.4.1 Contractor Proof of Insurance and Minimum Insurance Requirements.
As a condition to the issuance of any permit, the Contractor shall submit proof that the
contractor has: Workers’ Compensation insurance as required by law; general liability
insurance of at least $100,000 for any one accident and $300,000 for any one person; and
property damage insurance of at least $50,000 for any one accident and $1,000 for any
one piece of property.
Exception: The contractor insurance requirement may be waived by the Code
Official if a property owner is performing work on the property owner’s
homestead.
106.4.2 License Required. Licenses shall be required as provided for by state law.”

106.5.3 Expiration is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

“106.5.3 Expiration. Every permit issued by the code official under the provisions of
this code shall expire by limitation and become null and void if the work authorized by
such permit is not commenced within 90 calendar days from the date of such permit, or if
the work authorized by such permit is suspended or abandoned at any time after the work
is commenced for a period of 180 calendar days. Before such work can be recommenced,
a new permit shall be first obtained and the fee therefor may be required for a new permit
for such work.”

106.5.4 Extensions is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

“106.5.4 Extensions. Any permittee holding an unexpired permit shall have the right to
apply for an extension of the time within which the permittee will commence work under

Ordinance No. 2009-01 -- City of Richmond, Texas --  -- Plumbing Code 2006 -- 01-20-09 Page 2 of 5



that permit when work is unable to be commenced within the time required by this
section for good and satisfactory reasons. The code official may extend the time for
action by the permittee for a period not exceeding 90 calendar days if there is reasonable

cause. The fee for an extension may be one-half the amount required for a new permit for
such work.”

106.6.1 Work commencing before permit issuance is hereby deleted and replaced with the
following:

“106.6.1 Work commencing before permit issuance. Any person who commences any
work requiring a permit for the installation, alteration, addition to, repair or maintenance
of any fire alarm, detection or fire suppression system before securing a permit from the
code official may be subject to Section 108.4 of this code and to an administrative fee of
100% of the usual permit fee in addition to the required permit fees.”

106.6.2 Fee schedule is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

“106.6.2 Fee schedule. Fees shall be applied as set forth in Exhibit A, “Schedule of
Permit Fees -- 2006 City of Richmond Plumbing Code”

106.6.3 Fee refunds is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:
“106.6.3 Fee refunds. The Code Official is authorized to establish a refund policy.”
108.4 Violation penalties is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

“108.4 Violation penalties. “Persons who shall violate a provision of this ordinance or
code or shall fail to comply with any of the requirements thereof or who shall erect,
install, alter, repair or do work in violation of the approved construction documents or
directive of the code official, or of a permit or certificate used under provisions of this
code, conduct work without the required permit, or violate a stop work order, shall be
guilty of a misdemeanor and upon conviction is punishable by a fine not to exceed the
amounts as allowed by state law pursuant to Texas Local Government Code Section
54.001. Therefore, a Violation is punishable by a fine not exceeding two thousand
dollars ($2,000.00) for violations of a rule, ordinance, or police regulation that governs
fire safety, public safety, zoning, and public health and sanitation, including dumping of
refuse. All other violations shall be punished by a fine not exceeding five hundred
dollars ($500.00), but no penalty shall be more or less than the penalty provided by state
law for the same offense. Furthermore, each day that a violation continues after due
notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.”

108.5 Stop work orders is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:
“108.5 Stop work orders.

108.5.1 Authority. Whenever the Code Official finds any work regulated by this
code being performed in a manner either contrary to the provisions of this code,
without the required permit, or in a dangerous or unsafe manner, the Code
Official is authorized to issue a stop work order.

Ordinance No. 2009-01 -- City of Richmond, Texas --  -- Plumbing Code 2006 -- 01-20-09 Page 3 of 5



108.5.2 Issuance. A stop work order shall be in writing and shall be given to the
owner of the property, or to the owner’s agent, or to the person doing the work, or
if no person can be located a stop work order shall be posted on the site. Upon
issuance of a stop work order, the cited work shall immediately cease. The stop
work order shall state the reason for the order, and the conditions under which the
cited work will be permitted to resume.

108.5.3 Emergencies. Where an emergency exists, the code official shall not be
required to give a written notice prior to stopping the work.

108.5.4 Unlawful continuance. Any person who shall continue any work after
having been served with a stop work order, except such work as that person is
directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, will be in violation
of this ordinance and shall be subject to the prescribed penalties.”

SECTION 109 MEANS OF APPEAL is hereby deleted and replaced with the following:

“SECTION 109 MEANS OF APPEAL. The Board of Appeals shall consist of
members appointed by the City Commission of the City of Richmond, Texas, serving as

the Board of Appeals in accordance with the Building Code Ordinance, City of
Richmond Ordinance No. 2008-13.”

305.6.1 Sewer depth. Insert in brackets in two places as follows:

“twelve (12) inches”

603.2 Separation of water service and building sewer is hereby deleted and replaced with the

following:

“603.2 Separation of water service and building sewer. Water service pipe and the
building sewer shall be separated by a minimum 9 feet of undisturbed or compacted

earth.

Exceptions:

The required separation distance shall not apply where a water service pipe
crosses a sewer pipe, provided the water service pipe is sleeved to at least 9 feet
horizontally from the sewer pipe centerline on both sides of such crossing with
pipe materials listed in Table 605.3, 702.2 or 702.3.”

904.1 Roof extension. Insert in brackets as follows:

“six (6) inches”

Ordinance No. 2009-01 -- City of Richmond, Texas --  -- Plumbing Code 2006 -- 01-20-09 Page 4 of 5









